AGENDA

TUSAYAN TOWN COUNCIL REGULAR MEETING
PURSUANT TO A.R.S. § 38-431.02 & §38-431.03

Wednesday, January 8, 2014 at 6:00pm
TUSAYAN TOWN HALL BUILDING
845 Mustang Drive, Tusayan Arizona

Pursuant to A.R.S. § 38-431.02, notice is hereby given to the members of the Tusayan Town Council and to the
general public that the Tusayan Town council will hold a meeting open to the public on Wednesday, January 8, 2014
at the Tusayan Town Hall Building. If authorized by a majority vote of the Tusayan Town Council, an executive
session may be held immediately after the vote and will not be open to the public. The Council may vote to go into
executive session pursuant to A.R.S. § 38-431.03.A.3 for legal advice concerning any matter on the agenda,
including those items set forth in the consent and regular agenda sections. The Town Council may change, in its
discussion, the order in which any agenda items are discussed during the course of the meeting.

Persons with a disability may request a reasonable accommodation by contacting the Town Manager at (928) 638-
9909 as soon as possible.

As a reminder, if you are carrying a cell phone, electronic pager, computer, two-way radio, or other
sound device, we ask that you silence it at this time to minimize disruption of today’s meeting.

TOWN COUNCIL REGULAR MEETING AGENDA

1. CALL TO ORDER AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
2. ROLL CALL

MAYOR GREG BRYAN COUNCILMEMBER BILL FITZGERALD
VICE MAYOR AL MONTOYA COUNCILMEMBER JOHN RUETER
COUNCILMEMBER CRAIG SANDERSON

< One or two Council Members may attend by telephone
3. CALL TO THE PUBLIC FOR ITEMS NOT ON THE AGENDA

Members of the public may address the Council on items not on the printed agenda.
The Council may not discuss, consider or act upon any matter raised during public
comment. Comments will be limited to three minutes per person.

Members of the audience who wish to speak to the Council on an item listed as Public
Hearing should complete a Request to Speak Card and turn it into the Town Clerk.
Speakers will be limited to three minutes each.

4. CEREMONIAL AND/OR INFORMATIONAL MATTERS

Presentation from Tami Ryall (Interim Public Management) and Pat Walker (Pat
Walker Consulting, LLC) on Town of Tusayan Permit Fee Study

5. CONSENT AGENDA

ITEMS ON THE CONSENT AGENDA ARE ROUTINE IN NATURE AND WILL BE ACTED ON WITH
ONE MOTION AND ONE VOTE. PUBLIC HEARING ITEMS ARE DESIGNATED WITH AN
ASTERISK (*). MEMBERS OF THE COUNCIL OR STAFF MAY ASK THE MAYOR TO REMOVE



ANY ITEM FROM THE CONSENT AGENDA TO BE DISCUSSED AND ACTED UPON
SEPARATELY.

A. Minutes of the Town Council Regular Meeting on 12/18/13
B. Accounts Payable Billings
6. COMMITTEE REPORTS
A. Update on the Community Park Committee
B. Update on the Planning and Zoning Commission
7. ACTION ITEMS

A. Consideration, discussion, and possible approval of Design Review Case No.
DR2013-06, a Design Review for Interim Housing at Camper Village (Staff
recommends continuation until January 22, 2014 after Planning & Zoning
Commission consideration on January 14, 2014)

B. Consideration, discussion, and possible approval of Municipal Code Chapter 7 —
Building Codes

C. Consideration, discussion, and possible action on water bill for leak near water
meter at employee housing unit

8. DISCUSSION ITEMS

9. TOWN MANAGER’S REPORT
10. FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS

11. COUNCIL MEMBERS’ REPORTS
12. MAYOR’S REPORT

13. MOTION TO ADJOURN

CERTIFICATION OF POSTING OF NOTICE

The undersigned hereby certifies that a copy of the foregoing notice was duly posted at the é%erak Store in Tusayan,
Arizona on this 2™ day of January, 2014, at__{]: ¢( Am in accordance with the statément filed by the Tusayan

Town Council. %R® L/y/y{x&/h{"’f\ ‘ (/ P

Signature bf person posting the, ‘agenda




ITEM NO. 5A



TUSAYAN TOWN COUNCIL REGULAR MEETING
PURSUANT TO A R.S. § 38-431.02 & §38-431.03

Wednesday, December 4, 2013 at 6:00pm
TUSAYAN TOWN HALL BUILDING
845 Mustang Drive, Tusayan Arizona

TOWN COUNCIL SUMMARIZED MINUTES

. CALL TO ORDER AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Mayor Bryan called the meeting to order at 6:02pm and the Pledge of Allegiance was
recited.

ROLL CALL

MAYOR GREG BRYAN

VICE MAYOR AL MONTOYA - excused
COUNCILMEMBER BILL FITZGERALD
COUNCILMEMBER JOHN RUETER
COUNCILMEMBER CRAIG SANDERSON

Also present were: Will Wright, Town Manager
Melissa M. Drake, Town Clerk

. CALL TO THE PUBLIC FOR ITEMS NOT ON THE AGENDA

Former Mayor Pete Shearer suggested that reflective paint could be added to
crosswalks in town to help with visibility. Mayor Bryan stated that during the planning
stages, reflective paint was discussed and the state determined that it would not hold
up to snow plows. He said they could see if there have been improvements since
that time.

. CEREMONIAL AND/OR INFORMATIONAL MATTERS

Update from Coconino County Sheriff’'s Department

Lt. Jim Coffey presented statistical information on calls for service from the Sheriff's
Department in Tusayan from March through October 2013.

Lt. Coffey also presented information about RAIDS Online which is an online
application which maps crimes in the area.

He highlighted and briefly discussed the following activities in the area for the
Sheriff's Department:

- participation in the Angel Thunder disaster drill in early summer

- July 4" activities

- abomb threat on Labor Day weekend involving the Grand Hotel

- the federal government shutdown including the peaceful protest and the
governor's visit

- jail work crews’ work in the Community Park



He showed a short video on preparedness for workplace violence and discussed a
training to be held at the Grand Canyon National Park Airport in the spring.

The contract between the Town and the Sheriff's Department expires in June 2014.

. CONSENT AGENDA

A. Minutes of the Town Council Regular Meeting on 12/4/13 and Special
Meeting on 12/10/13

B. Accounts Payable Billings

Councilmember Sanderson made a motion to approve the Consent Agenda.
Councilmember Rueter seconded the motion and it passed on unanimous vote.

. COMMITTEE REPORTS

A. Update from the Community Park Committee

Manager Wright stated that a crew from the Coconino County Jail has done
additional clearing and the Tusayan Fire District (TFD) did some burning today in
the park.

Former Mayor Pete Shearer stated that TFD did some burning in the park earlier
than planned due to good conditions which allowed the smoke to travel away
from Tusayan.

B. Update from the Planning and Zoning Commission

Manager Wright stated that in the meeting on December 17, 2013, the Public
Hearing on the General Plan and the design review for the temporary housing at
Camper Village were continued until January 14, 2013. The design review for
the new signage at Canyon Plaza was approved.

He also stated that Town Planner Richard Turner gave a 2-week notice of his
retirement. His last day will be December 31, 2013.

The Council asked Manager Wright to express their appreciation for Mr. Turner's
work for the Town.

Councilmember Fitzgerald stated that there was a request at the meeting last
night to clarify the section on Water in the General Plan. He stated that there
were Commission members who requested additional meetings and discussions
to become more familiar with the Plan.

Manager Wright stated that the first draft of the plan was distributed in August
and the majority of the changes which have been made since then (with the
exception of the deletion of the water section due to the Arizona Corporation
Commission ruling) were minor. He stated that a redline version of the Plan will
be available on the Town website on 12/19/13 to help clarify the updates and he
will hold a meeting of the Technical Review Committee to clarify the changes.

Page 2 of 5



7. ACTION ITEMS

A. Consideration, discussion, and possible approval action to direct staff to
proceed with the purchase of a truck

Manager Wright stated that the Town has joined the State Purchasing
Cooperative and he has looked at new trucks there and used trucks at the State
Surplus. The Council discussed the options and determined that Manager
Wright should proceed with getting quotes on a new vehicle which is a 4-wheel
drive, heavy duty pickup truck capable of handling a snow plow if needed, with
regular cab instead of crew cab, and with good fuel economy ratings. They also
stated that he should look at the option of utility boxes along the bed and rhino
lining in the bed.

B. Consideration, discussion, and possible action to direct staff to proceed
with the purchase of a storage building and choose a site to locate it

Manager Wright discussed a quote for a portable storage building to house the
Toolcat and other maintenance equipment at the Community Park. The Council
discussed options for a building and its expected uses.

Kevin Dickerson from the School District requested that all storage be in the
building or fenced-in and not outside, that the temporary building be placed in a
location that is not where a permanent structure will be built in the future, and
that there is a small space reserved for the School District to store items. He
requested a review of the IGA for storage buildings which may require an
addendum.

The Park Committee will stake the location prior to the January 8" Council
meeting.

C. Consideration, discussion, and possible action to direct staff to issue a
request for proposal for Town Engineering services

Manager Wright discussed his letter to Willdan Engineering regarding federal
guidelines for Engineering Services for the CDBG project which prompted this
review of all engineering services. The Council discussed the situation and
determined that the RFP should be for engineering services, construction
services, and planning services; each as a separate contract.

Councilmember Rueter made a motion to authorize the Town Manager to begin
the RFP process for engineering services, construction services, and planning
services for the Town. Councilmember Sanderson seconded the motion and it
passed on unanimous vote.

D. Consideration, discussion, and possible approval of recognition for staff
and volunteers

Manager Wright discussed a memo he sent to the Council regarding recognition

of staff and volunteers for the year. He stated that other communities where he
worked in the past had similar programs.

Page 3 of 5



Mayor Bryan stated that he was in favor of the Council developing a recognition
program. Councilmember Rueter was in favor of ongoing recognition of
volunteers via certificates of appreciation but wanted more information on the
legalities of “gifting” monetary items. Manager Wright stated that he spoke with
the Town Attorney who said that there were no issues unless the monetary value
was very high.

Councilmember Fitzgerald stated that if a program is developed, there should be
2 separate programs: 1 for staff and 1 for non-staff.

Mayor Bryan requested 2 Councilmembers work with the Town Manager to
develop a program for recognition for staff and volunteers. Councilmember
Fitzgerald volunteered to serve on a committee and Mayor Bryan suggested Vice
Mayor Montoya be the second.

DISCUSSION ITEMS
A. Grand Canyon - Williams - Flagstaff Corridor Transit Study

Mayor Bryan introduced the Transit Study and stated that the major focus
was to reduce traffic between Flagstaff and Williams and provide shuttle
services. He attended the last meeting and invited other Councilmembers to
attend future meetings in his place. Councilmember Rueter expressed his
desire to attend future meetings.

B. Snowplay Area

Councilmember Rueter discussed 2 photos of a snowplay area north of
Flagstaff. He stated that a snowplay area in Tusayan would require a north
facing hill to maintain as much snow as possible. He suggested involving Lt.
Coffey in the process since he has experience with issues in other snowplay
areas.

Lt. Coffey spoke about traffic problems, injuries, signage,
communications/language, access, parking, security, and sledding sales as
related to snowplay areas.

Councilmember Rueter suggested that the Council keep a snowplay area
location in mind this winter.

Former Mayor Pete Shearer stated that he supported a snowplay area and
that locals have approached him asking for it. He also suggested that local
high school students could help in researching snowfall statistics, etc.

. TOWN MANAGER’S REPORT

Manager Wright highlighted the following from his report:

- the Town is now part of the State Purchasing Cooperative

- a Chase Bank representative stated that the local government investment
pool offers the best investment opportunities top the Town

- he is requesting a meeting with ADOT for several issues

Page 4 of 5



The Council requested that Manager Wright research

- the specifics of the billing for the TFD, specifically around the hiring of
administrative help for the district

- the status of the J2 Engineering drainage study

10. FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS

e January 22

o Discussion item for possible ordinance prohibiting approaching
and feeding wildlife

11. COUNCIL MEMBERS’ REPORTS
None
12. MAYOR’S REPORT

The Mayor stated that there was an interesting presentation at the Coconino
Plateau Water Advisory Council meeting this week regarding the Hopi water
wells. There was also a presentation about the Four Forest Restoration Initiative.

13. MOTION TO ADJOURN

Councilmember Rueter made a motion to adjourn the meeting at 9:05pm.
Councilmember Sanderson seconded the motion and it passed on unanimous
vote.

Greg Bryan, Mayor Date
ATTEST:

Melissa M. Drake, Town Clerk

CERTIFICATION
State of Arizona )]
} ss.
Coconino County )

I, Melissa M. Drake, do hereby certify that | am the Town Clerk of the Town of Tusayan,
County of Coconino, State of Arizona, and that the above minutes are a true and correct
summary of the meeting of the Council of the Town of Tusayan held on December 18,
2013, | further certify that the meeting was duly called and held, and that a quorum was
present.

DATED this 2" day of January, 2014

Town Clerk

Page 5 of 5



ITEM NO. 7B



TOWN OF TUSAYAN TOWN COUNCIL
CHAPTER 7 OF THE TOWN OF TUSAYAN TOWN CODE

FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE
AND THE NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING THE QUALITY, TYPE OF MATERIAL, AND
WORKMANSHIP OF ALL ASPECTS OF CONSTRUCTION OF BUILDINGS OR
STRUCTURES, PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTIONS OF
FEES THEREFORE, PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS, AND ESTABLISHING A
BUILDING AND SAFETY ADVISORY BOARD.

SECTION 1 The Town Council hereby adopts, by reference, the following codes: 2006
Editions, published by the International Code Council,

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE including Appendix C, E, F, G, I, J
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

AND

The 2005 Edition, of the NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE, published by the
National Fire Protection Association

Amendments are listed in Section 8 below. Three copies of the codes are on file with the Town
Clerk for the Town of Tusayan.

SECTION 2 These codes shall apply to the incorporated area of the Town of Tusayan.

SECTION 3 This ordinance and the codes referenced herein shall be administered by the
Town of Tusayan, Department of Community Development. The administrator shall be the
designated Building Official.

SECTION 4 It shall be unlawful to erect, construct, reconstruct, alter, move, demolish,
convert, or use any building or structure covered by the Ordinance contrary to, or in violation of,
any provisions of these codes. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of
these codes is guilty of a class 2 misdemeanor. Each day of continuance of the violation
constitutes a separate violation.



SECTION 5 If any section, subsection, sentence, or phrase of this Ordinance is held to be
invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of the
Ordinance. The Town Council hereby declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and
each section, subsection, sentence, or phrase irrespective of the fact that any one or more
section, subsection, sentence or phrase is declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 6 There shall be a Building and Safety Advisory Board to determine the suitability
of alternative materials and construction, to permit interpretations of the provisions of the code,
and to hear appeals and grant waivers to the codes. The Board shall be appointed by the
council. The building official shall serve as non-voting ex-officio member and shall act as
secretary.

SECTION 7 The Town Council shall, in a separate action, establish fees for building permits
and inspections.

SECTION8 The Town Council hereby adopts the following amendments to the Codes
referenced herein:



PART I: 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS

IBC 105

Amend IBC 105.1 by adding 105.1.3 to read as follows:

105.1 Manufactured Home Foundation: In Manufactured Home
Subdivisions, manufactured homes shall be set on permanent foundations built
of concrete block or poured concrete, utilizing a footing system according to the
Town detail. A manufactured home foundation will require a separate building
permit. The permit for a new manufactured home foundation will not be issued
until the permit for the manufactured home has been issued. The manufactured
home shall be anchored and shimmed to the foundation at four (4) feet on center.

IBC Chapter 2
Amend IBC Chapter 2, Definitions 202 by adding a new section 202.1 to read as follows:

IBC 310

Bedrooms/Sleeping Rooms, Similar Rooms and mmon_Space: A
bedroom/sleeping room is a room or space intended for sleeping purposes,
having an escape window, a smoke detector, having a level of privacy such as a
door, meeting all Code requirements for habitable space and generally located in
a dwelling unit as a point of final destination. Similar rooms include offices,
sewing rooms, studies, libraries, exercise rooms and dens that have the potential
of the same character and function as a bedroom.

Common space shall be considered a living room, family room, dining room,
recreation room, hallway and other spaces that are part of the main exit access
to the outside. A room or space shall be considered common space when there
is an open finished passage-way of at least four (4) feet wide minimum adjoining
the main common area. A second floor loft as a point of final destination shall be
considered a bedroom. These rooms or spaces shall be provided with a door or
an egress window to the outside and a smoke detector for purposes of escape
and life-safety except as approved by the Building Official.

Amend IBC 310.1 by adding a new section 310.1.2 to read as follows:

IBC 312

310.1.2 Efficiency(Studio Apartment) Dwelling Units: An Efficiency (Studio
Apartment) Dwelling Unit is any dwelling unit that is sized less than 480 square
feet but not smaller than 320 square feet in floor area and shall be located within
R-1 and R-2 Occupancies only, apartments, hotels, motels, and condominiums.
With the exception of individual rooms in Motels and Hotels, the minimum size for
other residential occupancies shall be four hundred eighty (480) square feet in
floor area, not including attached garages, decks, or porches. These shall include
all R-3 Occupancies: each dwelling unit of a duplex, detached guest house, or a
town house. These minimum dwelling units shall meet all applicable code
requirements.

Amend IBC 312.1 by adding a new section 312.1.1 to read as follows:

312.1 Floor Surfaces: The floor elevation of the garage or carport slab shall be
minimum three and one-half (3 %) inches lower than the finish floor height of the
house. The garage or carport slab shall be sloped 1/8 inch per foot toward the
garage door or approach end of the carport.



IBC 402

Amend IRC IBC 402.7.2 by adding a new paragraph to the existing section to read as
follows:
402.7.2 Tenant Separations: Tenant separations complying with section 708
shall be required between tenant spaces of commercial, industrial, office, retail,
shops and other multi tenant occupancy structures.

IBC 406

Amend IBC 406.1.4 by deleting the reference to one half inch (1/2”) adding a new
paragraph to the existing section to read as follows:

IBC 406.1.4 Separation: Where reference is made to the use of one half inch
(1/2”) gypsum board the reference shall be revised to reflect the requirement to
use five eights inch (“5/8) fire resistive gypsum board”

IBC 1008
Amend IBC 1008.1.1. by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

1008.1.1 Secondary Exits: Exterior doors of single family dwellings other than
required exits shall have a width of not less than two (2) feet eight (8) inches.
The common door between the interior of the house and the garage shall also be
a minimum of two (2) feet eight (8) inches. The minimum required door height of
six (6) feet eight (8) inches shall remain the same for all doors for habitable
space. Exception: five (5) feet sliding glass and atrium door units.

Amend IBC 1008.1.1 by adding a new section 1008.1.1.2. to read as follows:

1008.1.1.2 Doors in Accessory Structures: All detached accessory structures
i.e. garages, storage sheds, and enclosed barns shall have at least one (1)
egress door complying with the provisions on section 1008.1.1 minimum hinged,
swinging door to the outside which meets the requirements as for a required exit
door.

IBC 1505
Amend IBC section 1505 by the deleting the reference to the acceptance to Class C
roofing as an acceptable material. The minimum acceptable roofing material shall carry

a minimum class B listing; and by the inclusion of exceptions #1 and #2 to read as
follows:

Exception #1: Metal roofing shall be installed as a Class B roof covering
assembly by using approved underlayment sheets that are fire resistive, instalied
according to the requirements of their listing.

Exception #2: Listed and approved Solar Type shingles for the purposes of
generating electric power may be used that have a minimum of a Class C roof
covering assembly, installed according to manufacturer's specifications placed
over underlayment sheets that are fire resistive.



IBC 1608
Amend IBC 1608.1 by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

1608.1 Snow Loads: Snow Loads for roof design shall be considered as a non-
reducible live load on the roof. The Ground Snow Load shall be a minimum of
fifteen (15) pounds per square foot greater than the listed Snow Load.

IBC 1802
Amend IBC 1802.6 by adding 1802.6.1 to read as follows:

1802.6.1Fill Material: Fill material for slab floors in excess of four 12” in depth
shall be an engineered fill and verified by a soils report for compaction.
Engineered fill and soils reports shall be required for exterior and interior bearing
footings and foundations which do not extend into the undisturbed soil. Fill
material which is used in slab floor construction shall be limited to 3/8 inch or less
dirty cinder, “ABC” (aggregate base course), or native material when approved
by the Building Inspector.

IBC 1805
Amend IBC 1805 by adding a new section 1805.3.6 to read as follows:

1805.3.6: Foundation Attachment to Rock Footings may be attached, drilled
and pinned, to bed-rock, rock ledges and to large boulder rocks that are
unfeasible to remove only when the footing trench has been dug down to no less
than eighteen (18) inches into undisturbed soil. The top of a single large boulder
rock may encroach a maximum of twelve (12) inches within the top of the footing
trench.

The attachment shall be made by drilling into the rock a minimum of eight (8)
inches and using a number four (4) rebar pin driven into the hole securely or use
epoxy adhesive, with an extension of the rebar a minimum of fifteen (15) inches
long to make a lap with the footing or stem wall rebar. The pin spacing shall be
no less than four (4) feet on center and twelve (12) inches on center when
stepping over boulders.

Drilling and pinning of footings to rock located less than eighteen (18) inches into
undisturbed soil, the attachment of the pins shall be designed and the plan
stamped by an Arizona registered engineer.

IBC 1805
Amend IBC section 1805 by adding a new section 1805.3.7 to read as follows:

1805.3.7 Manufactured Home and Factory Build Buildings: Each site where
a manufactured home or Factory Build Building is to be placed shall be

sufficiently scraped and graded to remove all vegetation and organic material
down to where the grade is considered the top of undisturbed soil. This shall be
done before any fill is placed or footing blocks installed on grade.



A maximum of twelve (12) inches of fill of “ABC” or cinder floor fill adequately
compacted is allowed to be placed under the manufactured home or Factory
Build Building for the installation of the footing blocks.

Fills in excess of twelve (12) inches for the bearing of the manufactured home or

Factory Build Building on grade shall be designed by an engineer as engineered
fill.

When the footings are to be installed as poured concrete continuous footings
(runners), the footings shall be sized sixteen (16) inches wide and eight (8)
inches thick with two (2) continuous number four (4) rebar. These footings shall
be placed in a trench dug down eight (8) inches into undisturbed soil minimum.

Manufactured homes or Factory Build Building shall be anchored with approved
three (3) feet in length heavy duty auger anchors or equivalent with straps placed
four (4) feet from each end maximum and evenly spaced a maximum of twelve
(12) feet on center or according to manufacturer's specifications whichever is
more restrictive. When approval is given and a manufactured home is installed
in a flood plain the manufactured home or Factory Build Building shall be placed
on a code complying foundation system and anchored. When the required
elevation height of the manufactured home or Factory Build Building is within the
limitation for set-up, according to Arizona State Office of Manufactured Housing
and is grade-set the home shall be anchored with approved four (4) feet in length
heavy duty auger anchors with straps placed four (4) feet from each end and
evenly spaced a maximum of ten (10) feet on center.

IBC Table 2304
Amend IBC 2304.7 by adding a news section IBC 2304.7.1.1 to read as follows:
IBC 2304.7.1.1 Wood Decking: Wood decking on exterior decks shall have a
maximum spacing of 1/4 inch after shrinkage.

IBC Table 2304

Amend IBC Table 2304.7(3) by eliminating the reference “Without edge support’, in the
“Maximum Span” column, for all materials less than 15/32 in thickness.

IBC Table 2304
Amend IBC Table 2304.9.1 No. 24. Add the following as an additional description in the
table:
IBC Table 2304.9.1 #24 Built Up Girders: 2"x " built-up girders, four (4) or

more shall be joined together by one-half (‘%) inch through bolts, thirty-two (32)
inch o.c. staggered.

IBC 2304
Amend IBC 2304.11.5 by adding an additional exception:

IBC 2304.11.5 Exception #2: Glue-laminated structural beams exposed to
weather used to support decks, porches, and porch roofs may be of non-
pressure treated wood provided the glue-laminated structural beam is primed
and sealed (2 coats minimum) and that protection is maintained. These glue-
laminated structural beams shall be manufactured with exterior glue.



IBC 2308
Amend IBC section 2308.9.1by the addition of a new section 2309.1.1 to read as follows:

IBC 2308.9.1.1Wall Framing Details: All framing corners shall be accessible to
allow complete insulation. At exterior corners the third required stud shall be
placed parallel with the interior wall covering backing so as to allow full insulation
between the stud space of sixteen (16) inches or twenty four (24) inches. The
parallel stud shall make full contact with the stud of the perpendicular wall for
structural nailing.

At the intersection of an exterior wall and an interior partition the normal stud
spacing shall be maintained for the exterior wall with blocking installed (ladder
blocking) at sixteen (16) inches on center for the attachment of the intersecting
interior wall and as the required backing for interior wall covering.



Part Il: 2006 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE REVISIONS

IRC 105

Amend IRC section 105.1 by adding a new section 105.1.2 to read as follows:

IRC R115

R105.1 Park Model and Travel Trailer Recreational Vehicles (RV): Whenever

a Park Model, travel trailer, or recreational vehicle is installed as a dwelling unit
as part of a permanent home-site when approved by Conditional Use or when
installed in a Recreational Vehicle Park and having substantial improvements
such as additions or when installed in a floodplain, an Installation Permit shall be
required.

Additions to the Park Model, travel trailer, or recreational vehicle shall also
require a Building Permit.

EXCEPTION: A platform with a maximum size of eight (8) feet by twenty (20)
feet at a maximum height of twelve (12) inches above grade, located adjacent to
a Park Model or travel trailer RV shall not require a permit.

Amend IRC Chapter 1 by adding a new section R115 including subsections R115.1,
R115.2 and R115.3 to read as follows (Reference Chapter 5 in the 2006 International
Fire Code):

IRC R115: For new land divisions resulting in one or more buildable parcels of
land and where the access easement or right-of-way exceeds one-hundred fifty
(150) feet in length from the nearest Public Street, or accepted Private Road or
Street, an all-weather road at least twenty (20) feet in unobstructed width and
providing a minimum vertical clearance of 13'6” must be constructed to provide
access to the one or more new parcels. The road must be constructed prior to
initiation of construction or installation of any buildings or other structures, or the
introduction of any combustible materials, to the property.

For parcels where the topography or physical obstruction prevents road
standards from being met and prevents access by fire equipment all structures
shall be provided with an automatic fire sprinkler system.

IRC R115.1: An all-weather road is defined as a road capable of carrying a
minimum forty-two thousand (42,000) pound vehicle, or greater, as required by
the Tusayan Fire Department.

IRC R115.2: Bridges on private easements or on driveways exceeding one-
hundred fifty (150) feet in length must be engineered to carry a forty-two
thousand (42,000) pound load. Bridges on Public rights-of-ways or accepted
private streets or roads shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with
AASHTO HB-17



IRC Chapter 2

Amend IBC and IRC Chapter 2, Definitions R202 by adding a new section R202.1 to
read as follows:

Bedrooms/Sleeping Rooms, Similar Rooms and Common_ Space: A

bedroom/sleeping room is a room or space intended for sleeping purposes,
having an escape window, a smoke detector, having a level of privacy such as a
door, meeting all Code requirements for habitable space and generally located in
a dwelling unit as a point of final destination. Similar rooms include offices,
sewing rooms, studies, libraries, exercise rooms and dens that have the potential
of the same character and function as a bedroom.

Common space shall be considered a living room, family room, dining room,
recreation room, hallway and other spaces that are part of the main exit access
to the outside. A room or space shall be considered common space when there
is an open finished passage-way of at least four (4) feet wide minimum adjoining
the main common area. A second floor loft as a point of final destination shall be
considered a bedroom. These rooms or spaces shall be provided with a door or
an egress window to the outside and a smoke detector for purposes of escape
and life-safety except as approved by the Building Official.

IRC Chapter 2

Amend IRC Chapter 2, Definitions R202 by adding a new section R202.2 to read as
follows:

Engineered Fill: Engineered fill: Materials specified as to their composition,
placement, compaction and frequency of soils tests, by a Registered Arizona
professional engineer. Soils reports specified by the engineer are to be made
available to the administrative authority as a permanent record with the building
permit.

IRC Table R301
Amend IRC Table R301.2 (1) to include the follows criteria:

Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria
Snow Load — 40

Ground Snow Load — 15

Wind Speed — 105 Miles per Hour

Seismic Design Category — Do

Weathering — Moderate

Frost Line -30”

Termite — yes

lce Barrier Underlayment Required - Yes

Flood Hazard — The Flood Plain Administrator is the Director of Coconino County
Community Development.



IRC Table R301
Amend IRC Table R301.5 to read as follows:

IRC R303

Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads
Decks: Change the 40 pound per square foot load to 60 pounds per square foot.

Sleeping Rooms: Change the 30 pound per square load to 40 pounds per
square foot.
Storage Rooms: Add a new use category and apply 60 pounds per square foot

Amend IRC R303.8 by the addition of an additional paragraph to read as follows:

IRC R305

Required Heating: In single family dwellings where solar and/or wood are the
primary sources of heat, the dwelling shall have a conventional heating system.
Pre-wiring fixed electric space heating is acceptable as a minimum, or vented
gas space heating permanently installed. In single family dwellings that are off of
the electric utility power grid, vented gas space heating permanently installed is
required or the water distribution plumbing system shall be installed as a self
drain down system.

Amend IRC R305.1, including the exceptions, to read as follows:

IRC R309

R305.1 Minimum Heights: Change the reference to the minimum ceiling height
of 7 feet to 7 feet 6 inches.

Exception 3: Change the reference to the minimum ceiling height of seven feet
(7') feet to seven feet six inches (7’ feet 67).

Add an exception 5: Porch ceilings and their primary exit path, garages and
accessory structures, shall have a minimum ceiling height of; 7 feet — 0 inches
(finished floor to bottom of finished ceiling, beam, pipe or duct).

Amend IRC section R309.2 by modifying the reference to one half inch (1/2”) gypsum as
follows:

R309.2 Separation Required: Where reference is made to the use of one half
inch (1/27) gypsum board the reference shall be revised to reflect the requirement
to use five eights inch (“5/8) fire resistive gypsum board”.

R309.2: Further amend IRC section R309.2 by deleting the last sentence in the
section.

Amend IRC R309.2 by adding a new paragraph to section to read as follows:

R309.2.1: All attached garages shall have five eights (5/8”) inch fire resistive
drywall and materials rated for one (1) hour fire resistive construction on all walls
and the ceiling to provide a complete separation. Extending the fire resistive
drywall on the common wall taken to the roof sheathing is not acceptable
alternative. Openings that are located in walls under protruding construction of
the building with useable space above or an exterior exit balcony the underside

10



of the construction of the area above shall be of one (1) hour fire resistive
construction.

Amend IRC R309.2 by the addition of a new subsection R309.2.2 to read as follows:

R309.2.2: Attic Accesses covers through a fire restrictive ceiling of an attached
garage shall be constructed of three quarter inch (3% “) inch plywood and five
eights inch (5/8”) fire resistive gypsum board attached to the plywood using glue
and screws. The screws shall a minimum one inch (1") and be spaced a
minimum six inches (6”) on center in all directions. The supports for the cover
shall be supported by a 5/8 inch Type X drywall edge. A pull down ladder access
shall have a twenty (20) minute fire rating or shall have its assembly approved by
the Building Official.

IRC R309
Amend IRC R309.3 by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

R309.3 Floor Surfaces: The floor elevation of the garage or carport slab shall be
minimum three and one-half (3 %) inches lower than the finish floor height of the
house. The garage or carport slab shall be sloped 1/8 inch per foot toward the
garage door or approach end of the carport.

IRC R311
Amend IRC R311.4.1 by adding a new section R311.4.1.2 to read as follows:

R311.4.1.2 Emergency Escape from Basements: Any floor at grade level shall
have a 3068 (3’ x 6'8") minimum exit door providing direct access to the exterior
of the structure.

IRC R313
Amend IRC R313.2 by adding a new item 4 to read as follows:

R313.2 #4 Smoke detectors shall be required in garages, storage areas, or
workshops and shall be audible simultaneously with smoke detectors throughout
the dwelling unit. If a dwelling has a vaulted ceiling, a smoke detector shall be
installed between twelve (12) inches and eighteen (18) inches below the ridge
beam or the peak and shall be audible simultaneously with smoke detectors
throughout the dwelling unit. Smoke detectors installed on walls or ceilings shall
be kept a minimum of twelve (12) inches away from the corner. (Manufacturers
specifications recognize a dead air space within twelve (12) inches of the corner.)

IRC R319
Amend IRC R319.1.5 by editing the paragraph to read as follows:

IRC R319.1.5: Exposed Glued Laminated Timbers: The portions of Glued
Laminated Timbers that form the structural supports of a building or other
structure and are exposed to the weather shall be pressure treated with
preservative, or be manufactured from naturally durable or preservative-treated
wood.

11



IRC R403

Amend IRC section R403 by adding a new section R403.1.9 to read as follows:

IRC R403

R403.1.9: Footings may be attached, drilled and pinned, to bed-rock, rock ledges
and to large boulder rocks that are unfeasible to remove only when the footing
trench has been dug down to no less than eighteen (18) inches into undisturbed
soil. The top of a single large boulder rock may encroach a maximum of twelve
(12) inches within the top of the footing trench

The attachment shall be made by drilling into the rock a minimum of eight (8)
inches and using a number four (4) rebar pin driven into the hole securely or use
epoxy adhesive, with an extension of the rebar a minimum of fifteen (15) inches
long to make a lap with the footing or stem wall rebar. The pin spacing shall be
no less than four (4) feet on center and twelve (12) inches on center when
stepping over boulders.

Drilling and pinning of footings to rock located less than eighteen (18) inches into
undisturbed soil, the attachment of the pins shall be designed and the plan
stamped by an Arizona registered engineer.

Amend IRC section R403 by adding a new section R403.1.10 to read as follows:

R403.1.10 Manufactured Home: Each site where a manufactured home is to be
placed shall be sufficiently scraped and graded to remove all vegetation and
organic material down to where the grade is considered the top of undisturbed
soil. This shall be done before any fill is placed or footing blocks installed on
grade.

A maximum of twelve (12) inches of fill of “ABC” or cinder floor fill adequately
compacted is allowed to be placed under the manufactured home for the
installation of the footing blocks.

Fills in excess of twelve (12) inches for the bearing of the manufactured home on
grade shall be designed by an engineer as engineered fill.

When the footings are to be installed as poured concrete continuous footings
(runners), the footings shall be sized sixteen (16) inches wide and eight (8)
inches thick with two (2) continuous number four (4) rebar. These footings shall
be placed in a trench dug down eight (8) inches into undisturbed soil minimum.

Manufactured homes shall be anchored with approved three (3) feet in length
heavy duty auger anchors or equivalent with straps placed four (4) feet from each
end maximum and evenly spaced a maximum of twelve (12) feet on center or
according to manufacturer’s specifications whichever is more restrictive. When
approval is given and a manufactured home is installed in a flood plain the
manufactured home shall be placed on a code complying foundation system and
anchored. When the required elevation height of the manufactured home is
within the limitation for set-up, according to Arizona State Office of Manufactured
Housing and is grade-set the home shall be anchored with approved four (4)
feet in length heavy duty auger anchors with straps placed four (4) feet from each
end and evenly spaced a maximum of ten (10) feet on center.

12



IRC Table R503

Amend IRC Table IRC Table R503.2.1(1) by eliminating the reference “Without edge
support” in the “Maximum Span” column for all materials less than 15/32 in thickness.

IRC R503
Amend R503.1 by adding a new section IRC R503.1.0.1 to read as follows:

IRC R503.1.1.1 Wood Decking: Wood decking on exterior decks shall have a
maximum spacing of 1/4 inch after shrinkage.

IRC R602

Amend IRC section R602.3.1 by the addition of a new section 602.3.1.1 to read as
follows:

IRC R602.3.1.1 Wall Framing Details: All framing corners shall be accessible to
allow complete insulation. At exterior corners the third required stud shall be
placed parallel with the interior wall covering backing so as to allow full insulation
between the stud space of sixteen (16) inches or twenty four (24) inches. The
parallel stud shall make full contact with the stud of the perpendicular wall for
structural nailing.

At the intersection of an exterior wall and an interior partition the normal stud
spacing shall be maintained for the exterior wall with blocking installed (ladder
blocking) at sixteen (16) inches on center for the attachment of the intersecting
interior wall and as the required backing for interior wall covering.

IRC R902
Amend IRC section R902 by the deleting the reference to the acceptance to Class C
roofing as an acceptable material. The minimum acceptable roofing material shall carry

a minimum class B listing; and by the inclusion of exceptions #1 and #2 to read as
follows:

Exception #1: Metal roofing shall be installed as a Class B roof covering
assembly by using approved underlayment sheets that are fire resistive, installed
according to the requirements of their listing.

Exception #2:Listed and approved Solar Type shingles for the purposes of
generating electric power may be used that have a minimum of a Class C roof
covering assembly, installed according to manufacturer's specifications placed
over underlayment sheets that are fire resistive.

IRC G2406
Amend IRC G2406.2 by modifying provision #2, by deleting provisions #3, and #4 and
by modifying provision #5 to read as follows:

(G2406.2 Provision #2: Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented decorative
appliances, vented gas fireplaces, vented gas fireplace heaters, and decorative
appliances for installation in vented solid fuel-burning fireplaces receiving all
combustion air direct from the outside shall be permitted.

13



G2406.2 Provision #5: The door between the room and the appliance shall be a
minimum inch and three eights (1 3/8") fully weather stripped solid core door.
Furnace located in an attic or crawl space may be accessed through a closet.

IRC G2406
Amend IRC G2406.2 by adding to IRC G2406.2, # 6 as follows:

G2406.2 Provision #6: Equipment burning Liquid Petroleum Gas shall not be
located in a pit, an under floor space, below grade or similar locations where
vapors or fuel might unsafely collect unless an approved method for the safe
collection, removal and containment or disposal of the vapors or fuel is provided.

At grade crawl spaces, garages and non-habitable spaces in under floor
locations, and daylight basements shall be spaces where methods for safe
collection, removal and containment or disposal of the vapors or fuel may be

provided. Pits and below grade basements are spaces that LPG appliances are
strictly prohibited.

Combustion air for an LPG appliance shall not be drawn from a location where
LP gas is likely to drain or settle. 3. COMBUSTION AIR DRAWN FROM
OUTDOORS — Amend IFGC 304.1 and IRC G2407.1 by adding IFGC 304.1.0.1
and IRC G2407.1.0.1 to read as follows:

New construction and existing buildings that have been remodeled and durably
sealed against air infiltration as regulated under the International Energy
Conservation Code shall be considered Unusually Tight Construction. All fuel

burning appliances shall have the required combustion air drawn from the
outdoors.

All Appliances within habitable portions of a building shall be installed in a sealed
compartment with outside combustion air or be of the Direct-Vent type.

Exceptions to this requirement shall include: gas clothes dryer, gas cooking
range and oven.

IRC G2413.2

Amend section IRC Section G2413.2 to include Table 3804.3 from the 2006 International
Fire Code for the location of Liquefied Petroleum Storage Tanks and renumber as Table

G2413.1
Table G2413.1
Liquefied Petroleum Gas Storage
Container MINIMUM SEPARATION BETWEEN CONTAINERS AND | Minimum
Capacity BUILDINGS, PUBLIC WAYS OR LOT LINES OF | Separation
ADJACENT PROPERTY THAT CAN BE BUILT UPON Between

Mounded or Underground | Above Ground Containers | | containers

Containers "a" "p”
Lessthan125 | 10 5 None
125- 250 10 10 None
251-500 10 10 3
501-2,000 10 25 3

14




IRC G2415
Amend IRC G2415.7 by adding IRC G2415.7.1 to read as follows:

IRC G2415.7.1 Approved connection to LP Tanks: The connection of the
building gas yard line to the regulator at the LPG tank shall be a rigid pipe or an
approved, listed and labeled exterior flex connector (Manufactured Home Flex
Connector) sized for the full demand of fuel to be served.

Because the copper tubing that is generally used as the connection from the tank
to the regulator is a material that can be damaged when exposed above ground
outdoors. The copper tubing shall be installed as short as practical, to
compensate for expansion, contraction, jarring, vibrations and settlement (by the
use of bends, loops or offsets) as required by NFPA 58 section 3-2.10.6, and
protected from physical damage by being installed under the protective dome of
the LPG tank.

IRC G2415
Amend IRC Section G2415.9 by revising the section in its entirety changing the burial
depth as follows:

G2415.9 Minimum Burial Depth: for Black lron piping that is approved for
underground installation the minimum cover over the top of the pipe shall be
twelve (12) inches. For approved Plastic Pipe, the minimum cover over the top
of the pipe shall be eighteen (18) inches.

IRC G2422
Amend IRC G2422.1 by deleting the item # 1 of following paragraph.

IRC G2445
Amend IRC G2445.2 by deletion of text and rewrite to read as follows:

G2445.2 Unvented: decorative appliances, fireplaces, and room heaters are
prohibited for use within the residential structures

IRC M1411
Amend IMC section IRC M1411.3 by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

M1411.3 When condensate water is approved to drain on the ground outside of
buildings the condensate shall drain on to a concrete gutter stone 3 feet long
minimum so as not to collect water against the foundation. The discharge of the
condensate from the gutter stone shall drain out into the yard and away from the
building.

IRC P3103
Amend IRC section P3103.1 by inserting (12") into the second line of the first paragraph
in the space provided in the text.

15



IRC P3103
Revise section P3103.2 by deleting the text to read as follows:

P3103.1Every vent extension through a roof or wall shall be a minimum of three
(3) inches in diameter. Any increase in the size of the vent shall be made inside
the structure a minimum of one (1) foot below the roof or inside the wall

IRC E3301
Amend section E3301by adding a new section E3301.5 to read as follows:

E3301.5: Use of aluminum wire where specified throughout this code shall be
approved for Service Entrance Conductors and/or Panel Feeders Conductors
Only, and shall not be used for any other purpose.

IRC E3501
Amend IRC section E3501 by adding section 3501.8 to read as follows:

E3501.8 Temporary power will be permitted for construction under an issued
building permit for new construction. These services shall supply one (1) or more
fifteen (15) or twenty (20) amperes one hundred twenty (120) volt duplex
receptacles that are G.F.C.|. protected for construction purposes.

IRC E3505
Amend section E3505.4 by adding section E3505.4.1 to read as follows:

E3505.4.1: All multi-tenant occupancy structures, the sub-panel feeders shall not
be routed through an adjacent occupancy or building. If installed below-grade
the raceways may be either Schedule 80 Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit (RNC) or
Rigid Metallic Conduit (RMC). Above-grade raceways shall be Rigid Metallic
Conduit (RMC) and shall extend to a point a minimum or four (4) inches below
grade before transitioning to another material. An underground Schedule 80
Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit (RNC) may extend up to panel height if within its own
occupancy.

IRC E3801
Amend Section E3801 by adding a new section E3801.9.1 to read as follows:

IRC E3801.9.1: All receptacle outlets in garages, and basements shall be
installed a minimum of eighteen (18) inches above the highest adjacent finish
floor.

IRC E4109
Amend section E4109.1 by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

E4109.1 second paragraph: The ground fault circuit interrupter device shall be

motor rated (faceless G.F.C.l.) and readily accessible. (See N.E.C. definition for
accessible and readily accessible)

16



IRC N1102

Amend IRC N1102.1 including Table 1102.1 by adding IRC N1102.1, 1, 2, 3

Table 1102.1
Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component
Climat | Fenestration | Skylight Glazed Ceiling Wood Mass Basement | Slab R-Value | Crawl
e Zone | u-Factor (1) U-Factor | Fenestration | R-Value Framed | Wall R- | Wall R- | & Depth (2) Space
SGGC Wall R- | value () | Value Wall R-

Value (0 {c) Value

5 45 low E 74 n/a 38 15 (2X4 | 13 (3) 10113 R5 for 4 feet 10/13
Walls

1. When metal or aluminum windows are used they shall be Low E with a thermal
break. EXCEPTION — Windows for approved passive solar design.

2. When the slab and foundation insulation is applied to the inside of the construction
an additional R-5 one (1) inch of rigid insulation shall be installed vertically between
the top course of the stem wall and the edge of the slab as a thermal break.

3. There shall be alignment with the thermal barrier insulation and the air barrier in all

cases.
a) Insulation shall be installed in full contact with the air barrier on both sides
of exterior walls. The insulation shall be installed so as not to create any
voids around piping, wiring, blocking and any other obstruction within the
wall cavity.
b) Insulation shall be installed in full contact with the conditioned side of the

IRC N1102

air barrier of flooring above and in attics the ceiling covering below. The
insulation shall be installed so as not to create any voids around piping,
wiring, blocking and any other obstruction within the floor or ceiling cavity.

C) When faced insulation is used the tabs of the insulation facing shall be
lapped over the framing members.

Amend IRC N1102.4.1 by adding a second paragraph preceding the itemized provisions;
by adding new provisions #11 and #12; and by adding an additional paragraph following
the itemized provisions to read as follows:

IRC N1103

N1102.4.1 second paragraph: All frame construction shall have an approved
permeable Grade D minimum building wrap or building paper installed over the
panel sheathing or on the exterior stud surface when panel siding is used. This
application is recognized to avoid condensation on building materials and the
installation of a vapor retarder on the warm-in-winter side of the wall assembly
will not be required as stated in IECC 402.5 and IRC N1102.5.

11. Window and door openings shall be flashed by approved methods and
materials.

12. Approved sill seal gasket material shall be installed under the bottom sill plate
for slab on grade construction.

N1102.4.1 last paragraph: Based on the requirements for construction to be
durably sealed to limit air infiltration, all new construction, and existing
construction, that has been remodeled to meet the requirements of this section,
shall be considered UNUSALLY TIGHT CONSTRUCTION.

17




Amend N1103.2 by adding a new section N1103.2.4 to read as follows:

N1103.2.4: All rooms in a building that have a ventilation heat supply shall have
a return air duct system from each room, that will provide a path for return air
back to the main return air to keep all areas of the building at equal pressure.
EXCEPTION - Bathrooms, Toilet Rooms, Laundry Rooms and other similar
spaces need not be included in the system design.

Ducts and plenums shall be sealed with approved mastic at joints to provide for
an air tight system. Furnace equipment may be sealed with metallic duct tape.

IRC N1103
Amend IRC N1103.2 by the addition of an additional paragraph; and by the addition of
an additional exception to read as follows:

N1103.2.1 second paragraph: A minimum R-8 duct insulation shall be installed
on all duct work located in unconditioned spaces.

N1103.2.1 Exception #2 In existing construction where the floor and attic

trusses and associated clearances make it impractical to install R-8 insulation on
the main trunk of the system R-6 duct may be used.

18



PART lll: 2006 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE REVISIONS

IFGC 303
Amend IFGC 303.3 by modifying provision #2, by deleting provisions #3, and #4 and buy
modifying provision #5 to read as follows.

303.3 Provision #2: Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented decorative
appliances, vented gas fireplaces, vented gas fireplace heaters, and decorative
appliances for installation in vented solid fuel-burning fireplaces receiving all
combustion air direct from the outside shall be permitted

303.3 Provision #5: the door between the room and the appliance shall be a
minimum inch and three eights (13/8) fully weather stripped solid core door.
Furnace located in an attic or crawl space may be accessed through a closet.

IFGC 303
Amend IFGC 303.3 by adding to IFGC 303.3 Number 6 as follows:

303.3 Provision #6 Equipment burning Liquid Petroleum Gas shall not be
located in a pit, an under floor space, below grade or similar locations where
vapors or fuel might unsafely collect unless an approved method for the safe
collection, removal and containment or disposal of the vapors or fuel is provided.

At grade crawl spaces, garages and non-habitable spaces in under floor
locations, and daylight basements shall be spaces where methods for safe
collection, removal and containment or disposal of the vapors or fuel may be
provided. Pits and below grade basements are spaces that LPG appliances are
strictly prohibited.

Combustion air for an LPG appliance shall not be drawn from a location where
LP gas is likely to drain or settle. 3. COMBUSTION AIR DRAWN FROM
QUTDOORS ~ Amend IFGC 304.1 and IRC G2407.1 by adding IFGC 304.1.0.1
and IRC G2407.1.0.1 to read as follows:

New construction and existing buildings that have been remodeled and durably
sealed against air infiltration as regulated under the International Energy
Conservation Code shall be considered Unusually Tight Construction. All fuel
burning appliances shall have the required combustion air drawn from the
outdoors.

All Appliances within habitable portions of a building shall be installed in a sealed
compartment with outside combustion air or be of the Direct-Vent type.

Exceptions to this requirement shall include: gas clothes dryer, gas cooking
range and oven,

19



IFGC 401

Liquefied Petroleum Gas Storage — Amend section 401.2 to include Table 3804.3 from
the 2006 International Fire Code for the location of Liquefied Petroleum Storage Tanks
and renumber as Table 402.1

Table 402.1

Container MINIMUM SEPARATION BETWEEN CONTAINERS AND | Minimum
Capacity BUILDINGS, PUBLIC WAYS OR LOT LINES OF | Separation

ADJACENT PROPERTY THAT CAN BE BUILT UPON Between

Mounded or Underground | Above Ground Containers | | containers
Containers "a” "p”
Less that 125 | 10 5 None
125- 250 10 10 None
251-500 10 10 3
501-2,000 10 25 3

IFGC 404

Amend IFGC 404.7 by adding 404.7.1 to read as follows:

IFGC 404

IFGC 404.7.1 Approved connection to LP Tanks: The connection of the
building gas yard line to the regulator at the LPG tank shall be a rigid pipe or an
approved, listed and labeled exterior flex connector (Manufactured Home Flex
Connector) sized for the full demand of fuel to be served.

Because the copper tubing that is generally used as the connection from the tank
to the regulator is a material that can be damaged when exposed above ground
outdoors. The copper tubing shall be installed as short as practical, to
compensate for expansion, contraction, jarring, vibrations and settlement (by the
use of bends, loops or offsets) as required by NFPA 58 section 3-2.10.6, and
protected from physical damage by being installed under the protective dome of
the LPG tank.

Amend IFGC Section 404.9 by revising the section in its entirety changing the burial
depth as follows:

IFGC 621

404.9 Minimum Burial Depth: for Black Iron piping that is approved for
underground installation the minimum cover over the top of the pipe shall be
twelve (12) inches. For approved Plastic Pipe, the minimum cover over the top
of the pipe shall be eighteen (18) inches.

Amend IFGC 621.2 by deletion of text and rewrite to read as follows:

IFGC 411

621.2 Unvented: decorative appliances, fireplaces, and room heaters are
prohibited for use in residential structures.

Amend IFGC 411.1.1 by deleting the item # 1

20




Part IV: 2006 International Mechanical Code Amendments

IMC 307
Amend IMC section 307.2.1 by adding a second paragraph to read as the follows:

307.2.1 When condensate: water is approved to drain on the ground outside of
buildings the condensate shall drain on to a concrete gutter stone 3 feet long
minimum so as not to collect water against the foundation. The discharge of the
condensate from the gutter stone shall drain out into the yard and away from the
building.

PART V: 2006 International Plumbing code Amendments

IPC 904

Amend IPC section 904.1, by inserting (12”) into the second line of the first paragraph in
the space provided in the text

IPC 904
Revise section 904.2 by deleting the text to read as follows:

904.2 Every vent extension through a roof or wall shall be a minimum of three (3)
inches in diameter. Any increase in the size of the vent shall be made inside the
structure a minimum of one (1) foot below the roof or inside the wall

PART VI: 2005 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE REVISIONS

NEC 230
Amend NEC Article 230 by adding Article 230.2 (A) (7) to read as follows:

230.2 (A) (7) Temporary power will be permitted for construction under an
issued building permit for new construction. These services shall supply one (1)
or more fifteen (15) or twenty (20) amperes one hundred twenty (120) volt duplex
receptacles that are G.F.C.|. protected for construction purposes.

NEC 230
Amend Article 230.3 by adding article 230.3 (A) to read as follows:

230.3 (A) All multi-tenant occupancy structures, residential or commercial, the
sub-panel feeders shall not be routed through an adjacent occupancy or building.
If installed below-grade the raceways may be either Schedule 80 Rigid
Nonmetallic Conduit (RNC) or Rigid Metallic Conduit (RMC) . Above-grade
raceways shall be Rigid Metallic Conduit (RMC) and shall extend to a point a
minimum or four (4) inches below grade before transitioning to another material.
An underground Schedule 80 Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit (RNC) may extend up to
panel height if within its own occupancy.

21



NEC 310
Amend Article 310.2(B) by adding article 310.2 (B) (1) to read as follows:

310.2 (B) (1): Use of aluminum wire where specified throughout this code shall
be approved for Service Entrance Conductors and/or Panel Feeders
Conductors Only, and shall not be used for any other purpose.

NEC 210
Amend Article 210 by adding Article 210.64 to read as follows:

NEC 210.64: All receptacle outlets in garages, residential, commercial or
industrial shall be installed a minimum of eighteen (18) inches above the highest
adjacent finish floor.

NEC 334

Amend Article 334-10 by deleting conditions #3 and #4 and adding an additional paragraph
to read as follows:

334.10 - second paragraph: The cable assemblies regulated in Article 334 shall
be limited to the identified conditions throughout the article but limited to; for one
and two family dwellings and Multi family structures permitted to be constructed
of type VB construction as identified in the IBC.

NEC 358

Amend Article 358.12 by deleting conditions (3) and (4) adding a condition (7) to read as
follows:
NEC 358.12 (7) Electrical metallic tubing (E.M.T.) shall not be allowed for
underground raceways.
NEC 680

Amend Article 680-71 by adding 680-71(1) to read as follows:
680-71 (1) The ground fault circuit interrupter device shall be motor rated

(faceless G.F.C.1.) and readily accessible. (See N.E.C. definition for accessible
and readily accessible)

22



PART VII: 2006 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

AMENDMENTS
IECC 402
Amend IECC 402.1.1 including Table 402.1.1 by adding IECC 402.1.1.A.B.C.D.E
Table 402.1.1
Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component
Climat | Fenestration | Skylight Glazed Ceiling Wood Mass Basement | Slab R-Value | Crawl
e Zone | u-Factor (1) U-Factor | Fenestration R-Value Framed | Wall R- | Wall R- | & Depth (2 Space
SGGC Wall R- | value (@ | Value Wall R-
Value (b) (c) Value
5 45 low E 74 n/a 38 15 (2X4 | 13 9) 10/13 R5 for 4 feet | 10/13
Walls

1. When metal or aluminum windows are used they shall be Low E with a thermal
break. EXCEPTION - Windows for approved passive solar design.

2. When the slab and foundation insulation is applied to the inside of the construction
an additional R-5 one (1) inch of rigid insulation shall be installed vertically between
the top course of the stem wall and the edge of the slab as a thermal break.

3. There shall be alignment with the thermal barrier insulation and the air barrier in all

cases.
a) Insulation shall be installed in full contact with the air barrier on both sides
of exterior walls. The insulation shall be installed so as not to create any
voids around piping, wiring, blocking and any other obstruction within the
wall cavity.
b) Insulation shall be installed in full contact with the conditioned side of the

air barrier of flooring above and in attics the ceiling covering below. The
insulation shall be installed so as not to create any voids around piping,
wiring, blocking and any other obstruction within the floor or ceiling cavity.

c) When faced insulation is used the tabs of the insulation facing shall be
lapped over the framing members.

IECC 404
Amend IECC 402.4.1 by adding a second paragraph Additional paragraph preceding the
itemized provisions; by adding new provisions #11 and #12; and by adding an additional
paragraph following the itemized provisions to read as follows:

402.4.1 second paragraph: All frame construction shall have an approved
permeable Grade D minimum building wrap or building paper installed over the
panel sheathing or on the exterior stud surface when panel siding is used. This
application is recognized to avoid condensation on building materials and the
installation of a vapor retarder on the warm-in-winter side of the wall assembly
will not be required as stated in IECC 402.5 and IRC N1102.5.

11. Window and door openings shall be flashed by approved methods and
materials.

12. Approved sill seal gasket material shall be installed under the bottom sill plate
for slab on grade construction.

23




402.4.1 Last paragraph: Based on the requirements for construction to be
durably sealed to limit air infiltration, all new construction, and existing
construction, that has been remodeled to meet the requirements of this section,
shall be considered UNUSALLY TIGHT CONSTRUCTION.

IECC 403
Amend IECC 403.2 by adding a new section IECC 403.2.4 to read as follows:

403.2.4: All rooms in a building that have a ventilation heat supply shall have a
return air duct system from each room, that will provide a path for return air back
to the main return air to keep all areas of the building at equal pressure.
EXCEPTION - Bathrooms, Toilet Rooms, Laundry Rooms and other similar
spaces need not be included in the system design.

Ducts and plenums shall be sealed with approved mastic at joints to provide for
an air tight system. Furnace equipment may be sealed with metallic duct tape.

IECC 403

Amend IECC Section 403.2.1 by the addition of an additional paragraph; by the addition
of an additional exception to read as follows.

403.2.1 Second paragraph: A minimum R-8 duct insulation shall be installed on
all duct work located in unconditioned spaces.

403.2.1 Exception #2 In existing construction where the floor and attic trusses

and associated clearances make it impractical to install R-8 insulation on the
main trunk of the system R-6 duct may be used.

24



PART VIil: PRIVATE ROAD STANDARDS

IBC Chapter 33
Amend IBC Chapter 33 by adding a new section 3301.3 to read as follows (Reference
Chapter 5 in the 2006 International Fire Code):

IBC 3301.3: For new land divisions resulting in one or more buildable parcels of
land and where the access easement or right-of-way exceeds one-hundred fifty
(150) feet in length from the nearest Public Street, or accepted Private Road or
Street, an all-weather road at least twenty (20) feet in unobstructed width and
providing a minimum vertical clearance of 13'6” must be constructed to provide
access to the one or more new parcels. The road must be constructed prior to
initiation of construction or installation of any buildings or other structures, or the
introduction of any combustible materials, to the property.

For parcels where the topography or physical obstruction prevents road
standards from being met and prevents access by fire equipment all structures
shall be provided with an automatic Fire sprinkler system.

An all-weather road is defined as a road capable of carrying a minimum forty-two
thousand (42,000) pound vehicle, or greater, as required by the Tusayan Fire
Department.

Bridges on private easements or on driveways exceeding one-hundred fifty (150)
feet in length must be engineered to carry a forty-two thousand (42,000) pound
load. Bridges on Public rights-of-ways or accepted private streets or roads shall
be constructed and maintained in accordance with AASHTO HB-17

25



ITEM NO. 7C



TOWN O F TU SAYAN at the entrance to Grand Canyon National Park

DATE: January 2, 2014

TO: Tusayan Council Members
FROM: Will Wright, Manager

SUBIJECT: Water Leak at Employee Housing

This memo reviews the matter of a water leak that was noticed about October 1, 2013 at the employee
house located at 309 Airport Circle and to seek direction from the Council regarding how to proceed. A
brief background of this matter follows:

Surface water indicating a leak was noticed at a meter box adjacent to employee’s driveway on
about October 1, 2013;

Staff met with Mike Halpin at the time and determined the box was for employee housing then
staff was directed to make repairs to stop this leak, which was done on October 2-3, 2013;

The Town received water bill from Grand Canyon National Park Airport for employee housing on
October 8, 2013 (see attached) for $5,850 for water leak of 120,000 gallons at $.04875 a gallon;
Staff analyzed parts removed at the time of repair of pipe, fittings, etc. and initially found, after
consulting with MH contractor, this failure was “... due to the improper use of materials and
methods to install this water service line, which caused this costly water leak.”;

Staff sent certified letter to RC Homes and Development, Inc. on October 21, 2013
communicating our finding and requesting reimbursement to the town of $6,615 for the water
loss and repair costs; \

A response from RC Homes was not received, therefore, staff visited with town attorney in early
November , sending a copy of agreement for these services as well as the letter;

Staff sent letter (essentially the same one) to the Protek Group, Inc. on November 27, 2013;
Received a call from Mr. Al Rhoddan of Protek at the first part of December, 2013 about letter;
Town received Protek’s response letter on December 15, 2013 (see attached) giving reasons for
not accepting responsibility for their work and the resulting costs associated with water leak;

10) Took attachments of response letter with faulty part again to MH contractor for his opinion and

was told it appears the materials and methods were installed properly, however it appears the
one fitting was somehow faulty, resulting in its failure and this leak; and

11) Again, visited with Jeff Murray attorney with SimsMurray, LLC who indicated the town could

easily spend more than the $6,000 to litigate this matter and wanted us to review the facts and
data surrounding this case before deciding to move forward with any claim or litigation.

It appears that the fitting (picture attached) was damaged, which eventually caused this failure resulting
in the water leak. Staff would like Council direction on how we should proceed with this matter.

TOWN OF TUSAYAN P.0. Box 709, 845 Mustang Drive, Tusayan, AZ 86023 (928) 638-9909



' Jeff Murray 5:16 PM (16 hours ago)

| I
s
me

W;ll

| am forwarding your emiitts b;il re water usage. I'll let Bill weigh in on that, but | agree that an
argument can t:ertai‘ni? ade that the lease says @ $10/month. Have you asked ADOT/Lessor
about the charges in excess af $10/ month? What was their response?

As to your memo, | think it is very good and accurately explains the facts. | did not know about
#10 until | read your memo. | take it this is a new finding? So, is there now an issue with the
partiﬁttmg, as opposed to the workmanship? | wonder if ﬂmm is any additional warranty on
parts? ,

As to binding arbitration, | can check into that for you if you wish. | know typically, arbitration
through the American / /hﬁ’aﬁpn Association (AAA) is extremely expensive. | think the last time
| had a government with ’ néi g arbitration provision, the filing fee alone was $10,000 or
more. 1can check into t| irther if you want, to see if AAA has some kind of alternative
program for matters hsat quire arbitration, but where the claim is less than the filing

fee. Eitherway, an érbitrétiaa s like a mini-trial, or can be, and | believe your memo accurately
explains to the Courmithai ny | fB&S could easily exceed the $6,000 recovery. However, if we are
successful and the ciai[ . ed on contract, we could conceivably recover our fees from the
defendants, such that the Town would not be out of pocket any money,

Let me know how you want to proceed.

Sincerely,

Jeffrey T. Murray

Sims Murray LTD.

2020 North Central Awe,, Smte 670
Phoenix AZ 85004

Ph: 602.772-5503
x: 602-772-5509




ITEM NO. 9



VI

VIL

a)

Manager’s Report
January 8, 2014

ADMINISTRATION:
The Town is a member of the State Procurement Cooperative and will purchase the
Toolcat through this system as well as possible future items and have done preliminary
research on a truck for the town.
The Town is also a member of the State Surplus Program through the State Department
of Administration.
| have talked with the Local Government Investment Pool (LGIP), which the Chase Bank
representative indicated appears to be the best investment strategy for the town.
I contacted Coconino County regarding possibility of working with them for Building
Services in Tusayan.

ADOT - | haven't received an answer to my email with ADOT representative regarding
Right-of-Way permits regarding the replacement of the pole to hold several service
agency banners, work to fix the curb by the Seven Mile Lodge and assistance on improving
the safety for the crosswalks in town. The town was given a Special Event Permit
Application for the placement of the Christmas lights on the light poles through town.

AIRS — Mark Venuti, who works for Guardian and sits on the AIRS board, made a
presentation at the October 2nd Council meeting on the AIRS program. He gave good
information and direction for the town to join this program, but it will cost approximately
$35,000. This will be a discussion for next year’s budget.

BROADBAND - | talked with Bill Bolin, contractor for IT for Coconino County and Jim
Simms, another IT business owner familiar with Coconino County and Tusayan. They sent
some follow up questions to our discussion and then will come to make a presentation to
the Council in the next couple of months. Bill and Jim are going to be following up with
me to get a better idea of what is needed to proceed with improvements to our system.

BUDGET — completed for FY 2014 at about the same amounts as last fiscal year.

CDBG — Staff met with NACOG representative and completed various forms for the ERR
(environmental review report) which is required before we get final approval for this
project. lIsabel Rollins also suggested the town go through a procurement process for
engineering services that will meet federal requirements.

COMMUNITY PARK — A crew from the Coconino Jail has come out a couple of times to
continue clearing and grubbing of small brush and to do some rock work and apparently
will continue this practice with the next help on 1/14/14. L.P.s Excavating has been
bringing in dirt from the Grand Hotel project. In addition, | need to follow up with Art
Babbott regarding the County Parks and Open Space (CPOS) program to express Tusayan’s
interest in participating in this program.

COUNCIL FOLLOWUP:
Fire District hired Tyler Kroombeen EMT/FF and invoice represents the Town’s financial
obligation for salary, benefits and now housing with Administrative help on the way;
Coconino County Health Dept. submitted data on animal control that | emailed to
Council and will follow up with them about costs for these services; and
Council decided February 7" or g (Friday or Saturday) for a retreat, which staff has
been in discussion with League staff regarding topics of interest.



Xl

Xl

X,

XIV.

DEVELOPMENT/P&Z MEETING - Several items were heard by P&Z on December 17
including a hearing of the final draft of the General Plan, Camper Village Design Review of
Stilo’s development plan and a Use Permit for improved signage at Canyon Plaza. The
Commission continued both the General Plan and Camper Village Design Review until
January 14, 2014 with anticipation that the Council will hear them on January 22, 2014.
This will extend the stop work order for Camper Village that was issued on the November
14" until a development plan with design review is approved by Council. Richard Turner
submitted his two week notice to Willdan and the town last evening with his last day
being December 31, 2013.

DRAINAGE — J2 Engineering is starting phase 2 of the drainage study which will be under
the $40,000 cap for estimated costs for this study. | contacted ADOT for aerial maps of
this area to assist J2’s drainage study of Tusayan. However, ADOT has changed the way it
responds to municipal requests for mapping and we’ve not received these maps as vyet.
Further, J2 continue to put a proposal to do engineering for six drainage basins identified
on Forest Service adjacent to the town to mitigate flooding in town. This grant is provided
through the Secure Rural Schools program and has been suspended by federal
government at this time.

MUNICIPAL CODE — Working through a process of putting municipal code information
together for the Council and committee to review according to schedule shown on future
meetings. We looked at the Building Codes sections in early October 2013 and those
changes will be brought for Council approval after the first of the year. | also forwarded
information from Coconino Department of Health Services, who handles Animal Control
Services in the County and the town will consider their proposal for these services at a
future Council meeting.

PUBLIC OUTREACH - Lieutenant Jim Coffey came on December 18" to make a report
regarding law enforcement activities in Tusayan. Tami Ryall and Pat Walker will make a

presentation on January 8, 2014 regarding their work on the town’s building services
program,

SIGNS — town hall signs were installed and still trying to find a way to add the address
without spending about $700. Also, will need signage for park with new rules which the
Council approved the draft at their September 4" Council meeting, but forwarded them to
the School for their input. | did find out that the Park Service creates signs that we may be
able to utilize their service.

STILO — The Stilo agreement is currently on hold until development issues with Camper
Village are resolved. It is expected that Stilo will have a development plan with design
review for the P&Z Commission at a special meeting on January 14, 2014 with plans to go
before Council at the January 22, 2014 regular Council meeting. At this time, it is
expected that the Council will move on the First Amendment to the PADA with Stilo.



